From: Richard Kahn |

Sent: Wednesday, Movember 12, 2014 5:21 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Jeepers from Fortress

Attachments: SHBRK Scann14111117520.pdf; Untitled attachment 00175.htm

Jeepers has received 222,549.24 from =ortress Per attached backstop agreement that money must be =elivered to
Dubin within 5 business days Please advise of ok =or Darren to obtain wiring instructions for Jeepers to =end Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates =nc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fax

cell

From: Fortress VRF Investor =elations

Sent: Tuesday, November 11, 2014 7:26 =M
To: 'HarryBeller@gmail.com <mailto
Cc_; Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Fortress Value =ecovery Fund | LLC - =istribution

Harry,

Please note a =ortress Value Recovery Fund | LLC {the “Fund”) cash distribution =ith respect to the interest in the Fund
held by Glenn Dubin will be =ired on November 12, 2014 in the below amount. The distribution =5 effective October 1,
2014. Pursuant to the Assignment of =conomic Interest Agreement dated as of August 1, 2011 between Glenn =ubin
and leepers, Inc., the amount will be distributed to Jeepers, Inc. =n accordance with its wire instructions on file with the
=und.

Glenn Dubin: =222,545.24 wired to leepers Inc., Bank of New =ork
Please =ontact Nicole Higgins at_ui[h any =uestions,
Thank =ou,

Fortress VRF =dvisors | LLC

Fortress VRF =nvestor Relations

Fortress =nvestment Group

1345 Avenue =f the Americas
New York, =Y 10105
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