From: Richard Kahn <

Sent: Wednesday, August 5, 2015 3:14 PM

To: Adam Bly; Vera Savcic

Cc: jeffrey E.

Subject: MNote Repayment

Attachments: SHBRK Scann15051110405,pdf; Untitled attachment 00215.htm

please advise when payment will be made as =revious email promised payment last week jeffrey =raciously offered you
a 10,000 discount if note was repaid =romptly it is now almost 3 weeks since we began =iscussing repayment and no
monies have been received in addition to 10,000 discount jeffrey also has not received = months of interest totaling
5,283.15:

1) july 1 interest 2,699.96
2) aug linterest 2,583.19

please pay this note =mmediately
thank you

wrote:
i did not see payment hit our =ccount last week
please advise when payment will be =ade
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, =Y 10022

tel
fax

cel

On Jul =3, 2015, at 4:51 PM, Vera Savcic _ wrote:

We have the following comment to =he Settlement Agreement:

We think that Epstein should also release Seed Media Group as =art of the Settlement Agreement and
we think that Seed should be a =amed third party beneficiary with respect to such =elease.

If you can make these changes then pursuant to our signing =ff with Adam (and getting his direction to
pay you) we can fund. | =xpect we can complete this next week.

1

EFTA_R1_02170798
EFTA02718514



Thank you

Vera

On Jul =7, 2015, at 1:42 PM, Richard Kahn <_ wrote:

please advise on any comments on =ocs and when we can expect payoff

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK =ssociates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

New York, NY 10022

tel

fax

cel
On Jul =5, 2015, at 1:36 PM, Richard kahn |G ot
attached are settlement =greement and release / satisfaction of judgement as per your

=equest

please review and provide comments asap | would =ike note to be paid off this week
thank =ou
Richard Kahn
HBREK =ssociates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022
tel
fax
cell
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