
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Wednesday, November 12, 2014 4:31 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: September 
Attachments: 20141111163357459.pdf; Untitled attachment 00147.htm; 20141111163340413.pdf; 

Untitled attachment 00150.htm 

attached is allan and david hasson september invoice =n the amount of 19,950 

allan with david hasson =total of July / aug / sep 2014) = 47,200 allan with marks =aneth (total of july / aug / sep 2013) = 
=5,105 

please advise if ok to =ay 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Hasson 

Subject: September 

Date: November 11, 2014 at 10:23:58 PM =ST 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 

Cc: =/b>leanne Brennan =iebracht 

Hi =ich, 

Attached is the September billing, which includes =ostly corporate work but some personal tax work as =ell. 
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I have included a detailed bill, and an additional =ne for Southern Trust. 

Best, 

O 

David M. =asson CPA, PFS 

Seckendorf Hasson =amp; Reilly CPA's, LLC 

30O0 Marcus =venue, Suite 3w4 

Lake Success NY =1042 

Phone 

Fax - 

2 
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