
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2015 2:12 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: AVENUE FOCH PROJECT - 1st Advance & Fees 
Attachments: AVENUE FOCH - ADVANCE 241115.pdf 

 Forwarded messag= 
From: Comptabilite Cabin=t PINTO < 
Date: Tue, Nov 24, 2015 at 9:0= AM 
Subject: AVENUE FOCH PROJECT - 1st Advance & Fees 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Cc: M=C3 lanie LEMEUR < 
<mailto• > > 

D=ar Mr. Epstein, 

<mailto = > > 

Fees: =C2 =AO =C2 =AO =C2 72, 000 € 

TOTAL: =AO =C2 =A0 =C2 432,000 =82 

<=> 

Cou=d you please kindly proceed to the payment of 432, 000 € and keep =s informed of the date transfer? 

Best regards, 

=p class="MsoNormal">Accounts Department=u> 

CABINET ALBERTO PINTO 

Email : <mailto l> 

<= class="MsoNormal">Site Internet : www.albertopinto.com <http://www.albertopin=o.corni> 

EFTA_R1_02178767 

EFTA02719923



11, rue d'Aboukir 

75002 Paris (France) 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in tris communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, ma= constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of =he addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure=or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohib=ted and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in =rror, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.c=m, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, includ=ng all attachments. copyright -all 
rights reserved 
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