From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Tuesday, November 24, 2015 2:53 PM

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: Rodriguez Family - Annual Health Insurance coverage - November 23, 2015
Attachments: Antilles School Rodriguez Health Insurance 12012015-11302016 $7,092.00.pdf;

Untitled attachment 007192.htm

please advise if ok to pay carlos” annual family =ealth insurance in the amount of 7,092 obtained via his wifes job thank
you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
From: =/b>Daphne Wallace ~:_::-
Subject: =/b=Rodriguez Family = Annual Health Insurance coverage - November 23, 2015

Date: =/b>November 23, 2015 at 12:27:12 =M EST

Tos =/boRich Kahn <

Greetings =ich,
Check =equested by Carlos, due by Tuesday, December 1, 2015.

Antilles School: =7,092.00 (Health coverage 12/1/15- =nhsp; =nbsp; =nbsp;
=nbsp;11/30/16)

JE is aware, he asked me to make you aware.

Please advise if okay to =rocess for the package today, DW
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