
To: jeevacation©gmail.comjjeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation©gmail.corn] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Mon 8/13/2012 4:00:14 PM 
Subject Adam Bly 

adam is now 2 months behind in interest payments - July llth and August 11th 
in addition we still have not received back comments or signed dots for transfer of promissory 
note 

please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Date: August 8, 2012 3:17:21 PM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein .cieevacation mail.com>
Subject: Fwd: No subject 

his response is rather frustrating as he requested loan to be transferred from him 
individually to Seed and should have had this pre approved by his board 

in addition our interest should be earmarked as a priority (after not being paid for over 18 
months) and not dependent on his air collections 

should i communicate this to adam? 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE 
AS FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Adam Bly 
Date: August 7, 21.11.111 M
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: No subject 

I have no update yet on loan documents because it's not only my decision but do 
know that the interest payment is imminent -- we've just been in an 
unusual period of very high uncollected A/R. Appreciate your 
patience. 

On 6 Aug 2012, at 16:47, Richard Kahn wrote: 

i have not heard back from you regarding interest 
payment or loan documents 
please advise 

PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH MY 
CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

fa 
cell 

On Aug 2, 2012, at 8:12 PM, Adam Bly wrote: 

Hi Rich 
Was with my Board today. Will call you with 
updates tomorrow or Monday latest. Interest 
payment should be next week as well. 
Adam 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 2, 2012, at 4:15 PM. "Richard Kahn" 

• Mli wrote:

Please update me on status of July Ilth interest due in the amount of 
S6,000 

Thank you 
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PLEASE NOTE EFFECTIVE JUNE 5TH 
MY CONTACT INFO WILL BE AS 
FOLLOWS: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New k 10022 
to 
fa 

cell 
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