
To: jeevacationigEgmail.comueevacation©gmail.comj: Jeffrey Elieevacationggmail.comj 
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent Mon 8/4/2014 12:50:08 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Interest journal entry was made to increase loan balance to 3x. No payment of interest, just a 
journal entry 

On Aug 4, 2014, at 8:34 AM, "Jeffrey E." <jecvacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

to summarize artspace. I numbers don't see to match, to press or stories. 2 is 
john murphy competent to read us financails. 3. did you see any email extending 
the amount of loans. did tax disrepancies get recitified. , did cap table. ? interst 
payment of 586k, ? it appears to me is that they are and have been bankrupt for a 
wwhile. . payroll taxes. cobra? any litigation ? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jgcsacatioraginail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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