To: i ion@gmail. com[jeevacation@amail.com];, Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From:

Sent: Sun 9/22/2013 10:02:19 PM

Subject: Re:

Thank you Jeffrey, u r great!!!

On 22.9.2013, at 21:16, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail com™> wrote:

I will pay
On Sunday, September 22, 2013, - wrote:

[ need to to do lot of homework to collect lot of documents (references, letters,
pictures etc), | already sent her my portfolio and all the pictures from any fashion
show I did. Than pay this visa fee and | hope I'm gonna get it. But she said she
was sure | would get it. I just need to get lot of letters from american ppl in
fashion to 'prove’ government that 1 will have lot of opportunities to work in US
as model.

how did it go with the lawyer?
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