
To: jeevacation©gmaitcomijeevacationetgmaiLeomj: Jeffrey Elieevacationggmailcomj 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Tue 7/22/2014 5:48:31 PM 
Subject: PROPOSAL #4 for KARYNA 
KARYNA PROPOSAL 004.pdf 
ATT00001 

attached is proposal from Erin for Karyna apt in the amount of 19,284.24 
Karyna has approved all but 1 item 
Proposal refers to ref #'s yet i ahve not seen details on any of items such as vendor, picture and 
specifics such as shipping, etc 
Please advise if i should pursue more detail, pay or hold attached proposal 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

From: K 

Subject: Re: PROPOSAL #4 
for KARYNA 
Date: July 21, 2014 at 7:17:20 
PM EDT 
To: 

Richard Kahn 

Looks right to me , except I am not sure about the roman shade 
for the bedroom since we are 
doing curtains, will check with 
Erin. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 21, 2014, at 5:28 PM 

wrote: 

Hello Karyna 

EFTA_R1_02209300 
EFTA02723369



Can you please 
confirm that you 
approved below. 
Hope you are doing 
ok 
X 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Richar 
d Kahn 

Date: Jul 21, 2014 at 4:22:29 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Fwd: PROPOSAL #4 for KARYNA 

i would 
have 
Karyna 
approv 
e then 
we can 
send to 
jee 
what 
does 
ref# 
mean 
next to 
each 
item -
are 
there 
picture 
s/ 
descrip 
tion of 

EFTA_R1_02209301 

EFTA02723370



vendor 
? etc.. 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 

Subject: Fwd: PROPOSAL #4 for 
KARYNA 
Date: July 21, 2014 at 11:34:26 AM EDT 

Hello Rich 
Erin sent me below quote for items she says 
have been approved by Karyna. i.c.: approved 
by JE 
How should we proceed? 
Shall ask Karyna to approve the list. 
Thank you 

We are almost done!!! Here is the latest proposal for items karyna has approved. We hope 
to move everything in by the end of the month. I am just waiting for the bed to 
ship which should be next week. Hope you are well. 

Scat from my Venial Wimless 40 LTE mmemteme 
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