
To: jeevacationftmaitcom[jeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Tue 9/11/2012 6:44:26 PM 
Subject Re: 

confirming 200k not 250k 
if 200k should i communicate this to darren or will you 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 11, 2012, at 9:59 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

ok for darren 200k 
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