To: jeevacation@gmail. com[jeevacation@amail com); Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Peaggy Siegal

Sent: Thur 12/13/2012 6:49:46 PM

Subject: Re: Fw: Fwd: Fw: Tax Return

| sent it before. I am telling you Philip Michaels told me not to send it.

I had appraisal done as soon as my mother died. . And did not hire lawyer until afier appraisal was
done.
Peggy Siegal Company

Mobil

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, 13 Dec 2012 10:48:18 -0500
To: <G

Subject: Re: Fw: Fwd: Fw: Tax Return
did he not have the apprasial before that

On Thu, Dec 13, 2012 at 10:29 AM, Pegey Siegal </ NG - - oic:

? Peg

Peggy Siegal Company
Office
Maobil

From
Date: Thu, 13 Dec 2012 09:18:15 -0500 (EST)
To:

Suhjeét: Fwd: Fw: Tax Return

Peaay,
I am a little confused by your request, since on October 11, | sent you a letter indicating Tax Form 1041
and Tax Form 1040 were filed on October 11.

Gary

Gary Siegal
Satco Products, Inc.

W satco. com
waww . nuvolighting. com

WiwW kolourone. com

From: S
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To:
Sent; 12/13/2012 8:50:38 A.M. Eastern Standard Time
Subj: Fw: Tax Return

-——-0riginal Message—-—

From: Peggy Siegal

To: Garysiegal

To: Garysiegal

ReplyTo. I
Subject: Tax Retum

Sent: Dec 11, 2012 4:08 PM

Gary:

Please tell me the date that the tax return was filed. It was not included in the information you

sent.
Thank you.
Peggy
Pegay Siegal Company
Offic
Mobil

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copynight -all rights reserved
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