To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@amail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinfjeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Fri 21/2013 9:08:28 PM

Subject: Fwd: RE:

i will look for 15mm monday
Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Eileen Alexanderson <
Date: February 1, 2013 3:48:21 PM EST

To: 'Richard Kahn' <
Subject: RE:

Sent appraisal and collateral lists to JE yesterday-do you need a copy also?
Funds will be wired Monday

From: Richard Kahn
Sent: Friday, February 01, 2013 2:44 PM
Cc: Eileen Alexanderson
Subject: Re:

i wanted to follow up regarding JEE request for list of all art

in addition i did not see that wire hit PR First Bank account - will it be sent today
or monday?

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
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On Jan 31, 2013, at 4:00 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

could you send me a list of all the art , and delineate what is collateral for the
loan.

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential
and intended sclely for the person or entity to whom they are
addresszed and may contain confidential and/er privileged
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or

other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this
information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in
error please contact the sender and delete the material from

any computer.

Apollo Global Management, LLC
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