
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueeyacation@gmail.com] 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Wed 9/7/2011 5:58:24 PM 
Subject: Dr. Magnani 
12123979008-0907-123505-383.odf 

Do I have your permission to pay $440 for isit to ni on June 3rd as the 
appointment was scheduled by Lesley? Total amount due for s S2215. Bill attached. 
Thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: RingCentral 
Date: Septembe 
To: Bella Klein 
Subject: New F 09/07/2011 at 
12:35 PM 

You Have a New Fax Message 

From: 

Received: Wednesday, September 07, 2011 at 12:35 PM 

Pages: 1 

To: 

To view this message, p ease open e a ac men or login to your RingCentral 
account by clicking here. 

Thank you for using RingCentral. 

Love RingCentral? Refer a friend 
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