
From: 
To: 
Cc: 
Subject 
Date 

ui c ow up 
Saturday, July 22, 2023 11:48:27 AM 

Agree, thanks very much. 

From: 
Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 10:16:18 PM 
To: 

Cc: 
Subject: Fwd: Leon Black follow up 

- unless you disagree, I'll just tell that I will respond to Jeanne directly 
and try to l mit e back and forth. As discussed wi , there does not appear to be any 
evidence of overlap with Maxwell other than the allegations of the victim in DANY's open 
investigation of Black and CRU doesn't intend to open anything separate based on current 
information. 

Thanks, 

From: 
Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 10:03:32 PM 
To: 

Subject: Fwd: Leon Black follow up 

Please see below. , have you been able to circle back with Jeanne after reviewing the 
DANY materials?  can respond and co iou to remind her to reach out to you, unless you'd 
prefer a different approach. Copying and since this overlaps with 
Epstein/Maxwell. 

From: Jeanne M. Christensen 
Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 9:55 PM 
To: 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Leon Black follow up 

In ase you have not heard it has been discovered that Leon Black paid 62.5 million to USVI -
and this does not include payments of money to individual women - it's outrageous that 
criminal charges have not been brought against him. 
I've heard one lawyer represents ten women that he sexually assaulted. 
littps:Umnsm.reuters.comilegallinvestor-leon-black-settles-with-us-virgin-islands-over-epstein-
probe-2023-07-21/ 
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I hope that your office is going to take a hard look based on this new information. 

Jeanne M. Christensen 
Partner 

WIGDOR LLP 

www wigdorlaw corn 

This communication may contain Confidential or Attorney-Client Privileged Information 
and/or Attorney Work Product. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message or its 
intended recipient (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person(s)), do not read, 
copy, or forward this message to anyone and, in such case, please immediately destroy or 
delete this message, including any copies hereof, and kindly notify the sender by reply e-mail, 
facsimile or phone. Thank you. 
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